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ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT
P. O. Box 170

Port Allen, Louisiana 70767-0170

Phone (225) 387-2249

Fax    (225) 387-4742







June 1, 2022





A Regular Board Meeting of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District was held in the office of the Board in Port Allen, Louisiana at 4:00 pm, Wednesday, 
June 1, 2022. President John Grezaffi called the meeting to order and declared a quorum present. The following members were present:

COMMISSIONER


PARISH

Bill Flynn



West Baton Rouge

Kenneth Gordon


West Baton Rouge

John Grezaffi


Pointe Coupee

Mark Guillory


St. Landry

Karen Jewell



Iberville
Earl Matherne


Assumption

Sean McGee



Iberia

Nickie Rockforte


Pointe Coupee

Tommy Thibodeaux

St. Martin

Absent: 

Spencer Harvey


Ascension

Daniel Hebert


Iberville

Jody Meche



St. Martin

Also Present:

INDIVIDUAL


REPRESENTING

Travis Johnson 


CPRA



Dale Holly 



ELO Environmental
William Tyson


Executive Director
Nicholas Rockforte


Attorney for Levee Board

Richard Sparks


Levee Board Operations Superintendent
Kristy Jewell


Human Resource Analyst
Tiffany Weber


Administrative Program Specialist A

Janice Jarreau


Administrative Program Manager

Crissi Canezaro


Administrative Program Specialist A

                                                                    * * * * 
President John Grezaffi asked for public comments. Hearing none, he proceeded with the meeting agenda. 

                                                                     * * * * 
Upon reviewing the minutes, Karen Jewell asked that the first paragraph be amended to state the meeting was held at the office of the Board in Port Allen. Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Kenneth Gordon, and unanimously carried to approve the amended minutes of May 4, 2022, and publish the minutes in the official journal. 
                                                                     * * * * 
Secretary Janice Jarreau read the following Resolution:
RESOLUTION


BE IT RESOLVED, that the following millage(s) are hereby levied on the 2022 tax roll on all property subject to taxation by the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District:








MILLAGE



  Constitutional 


4.01 mills

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the proper administrative officials of the Parishes of Ascension, Assumption, Iberia, Iberville, Pointe Coupee, St. Landry, St. Martin and West Baton Rouge State of Louisiana, be and they are hereby empowered, authorized, and directed to spread said taxes, as hereinabove set forth, upon the assessment roll of said Parish for the year 2022, and to make the collection of the taxes imposed for and on behalf of the taxing authority, according to law, and that the taxes herein levied shall become a permanent lien and privilege on all property subject to taxation as herein set forth, and collection thereof shall be enforceable in the manner provided by law.


The foregoing resolution was read in full, the roll was called on the adoption thereof, and the resolution was adopted by the following votes:


YEAS:
  9


NAYS:  0


ABSTAINED:  0


ABSENT:  4
CERTIFICATE


I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and exact copy of the resolution adopted at the board meeting held on June 1, 2022, at which meeting a quorum was present and voting.


Port Allen, Louisiana, this 1st day of June, 2022.

________________________________________

John Grezaffi, President
    The foregoing resolution was read in full, the roll was called on the adoption thereof, and the resolution was adopted by the following votes:


YEAS:  Commissioners Flynn, Gordon, Grezaffi, Guillory, Jewell, Matherne, McGee, Rockforte, and Thibodeaux


NAYS:  None


ABSTAINED:  None


ABSENT:  Commissioners Harvey, Hebert, and Meche

                                                                     * * * * 








NOTICE

Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin

Levee District up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June 1, 2022, for the leasing for campsite of the following described property, to-wit, bid related materials may be obtained and electronic bids may be submitted online at www.centralbidding.com:
Lot, 100 feet wide by approximately 400 feet in depth, from the centerline of Hwy. 977 to the waters edge of the old borrow pit, located in Section 22, Township 13 South, Range 12 East, Parish of St. Martin, Louisiana.  A map and plat of the site are available at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District office at 525 Court Street, Port Allen, Louisiana or call 225-387-2249.


Said bids will be publicly opened at the office of said Board in Port Allen, Louisiana on June 1, 2022 at 4:00 p.m.


The said property will be leased as one tract for cash, to be paid in full, submitted with bid, for a period of three (3) years, for the purpose of campsite.


Prospective bidders are to satisfy themselves as to the validity of the land title prior to submitting their bids, inasmuch as the land will be leased without warranty of title except as against the Board's own acts.


The successful bidder is required to submit proof of liability insurance of not less than $1,000,000 on the leased land with the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District being named on the policy as additionally insured.  Copies of the lease form to be executed are available at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District office.


The land will be leased subject to any oil, gas and mineral lease, that may exist now or be entered into in the future, the bonus, rentals and royalties from which shall be reserved to the Board.  All mineral rights shall be reserved to the Board in perpetuity in accordance with the Constitution.


The Board will not consider any bids submitted for less than $500.00, per campsite, per year.


The Board reserves the right to reject any and all bids.



It is mandatory that all bids are submitted on forms provided by the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District otherwise bid will be considered null and void, bid forms are available at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District office, (525 Court Street) P.O. Box 170, Port Allen, Louisiana, 70767, telephone number (225)387-2249.  All Bids should be marked in bold print “Campsite Bid.”

John Grezaffi





 
Janice G. Jarreau

President








Secretary

The following bid was duly opened and read:

Randy Leonard
Pierre Part, LA 

$500.00 per year for 3 years at a total of $1500.00

Commissioner Tommy Thibodeaux moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to accept the bid as submitted.

                                                                     * * * * 
ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS

OFFICIAL JOURNAL


Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District, at 525 Court Street, Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June 1, 2022, for printing and publication of minutes of meetings of the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District and all other legal advertisements required by law for a period of one (1) year.  


All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid received subsequent to 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.


The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.


Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked “BID - OFFICIAL JOURNAL.”

Janice G. Jarreau




 John Grezaffi

Secretary





 President

3t

Pointe Coupee Banner, Plaquemine Post South and West Side Journal

May 9, 16, and 23, 2022.

The following bids were duly opened and read:

Pointe Coupee Banner

$5.00 per square inch

Plaquemine Post South

$6.00 per square inch

Commissioner Sean McGee moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to accept the lowest bid.

                                                             NOTICE

Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners, Atchafalaya Basin 

Levee District, in its Office in Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June 1, 2022 

and can also be submitted online at www.centralauctionhouse.com for:

(1)

Furnishing Gasoline and Diesel Fuel delivered at designated locations

within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months

beginning July 1, 2022 and ending June 30, 2023.

(2)

Furnishing Crushed Limestone delivered at designated locations within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months beginning July 1, 2022 and ending June 30, 2023.

All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid

received after 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.

The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.

Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked





 “BID – FUEL” or “BID - AGGREGATES.”
Specifications, proposal forms, etc., are available at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee 

District Office, (525 Court Street) P. O. Box 170, Port Allen, Louisiana 70767, telephone

number (225) 387-2249.

Janice G. Jarreau





John Grezaffi

Secretary






            President

3t

Daily Journal of Commerce, The Advocate, Plaquemine Post South, and Pointe Coupee Banner

May 9, 16, and 23, 2022
                                                                     * * * * 
The following bids were duly opened and read:

 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1
ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT

TABULATION OF BIDS

Wednesday, June 1, 2022
DESCRIPTION
	Name of Bidder
	Acadiana

Shell
	Bear Industries
	Slats

Lucas
	R.J Thibodeaux Shell 
	Moreau’s 

Material

Yard



	
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton

	ITEM #1

Crushed 
Limestone (#57)
	$41.40


	$54.75
	NO BID
	$50.00
	$35.00

	ITEM #2

Crushed Limestone(#610)
	$39.90
	$53.75
	NO BID
	$48.00
	$34.00

	ITEM #3

Crushed Limestone(#57)
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$33.50
	NO BID
	NO BID

	ITEM #4

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	NO BID
	$39.75
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	ITEM #5

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	$48.90
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$44.00
	NO BID

	ITEM #6

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	$59.30
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$46.75
	NO BID

	ITEM #7
Crushed Limestone (#57)
	NO BID
	$59.25
	$42.45
	$48.00
	NO BID

	ITEM #8

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	NO BID
	$54.25
	NO BID
	48.00
	NO BID

	ITEM #9

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	$49.50


	$57.75
	NO BID
	$48.00
	$42.10

	ITEM #10

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$53.00
	$39.00

	ITEM #11

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	$54.00
	NO BID
	$47.45
	$48.00
	NO BID

	ITEM # 12

Crushed 

Limestone (#57)
	$53.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$46.00
	$48.00

	ITEM #13

Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	NO BID
	NO BID
	$32.50
	NO BID
	NO BID

	ITEM #14
Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	NO BID
	$38.75
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID


Commissioner Sean McGee moved, seconded by Commissioner Nickie Rockforte, and

unanimously carried to take the bids under advisement.

The following bides were duly opened and read:

ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT

TABULATION OF BIDS

Gasoline and Diesel Fuel delivered at designated locations within the District in quantities as requested for one year beginning July 1, 2022 and ending June 30, 2023.

	Unleaded Fuel
	Morel

Lemoine
	Gaubert 

Oil
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 1 Ravenswood
	.129
	.25
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 2

Ravenswood
	.129
	.25
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 3 

Maringouin
	.129
	.25
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 4

Henderson
	.16
	.25
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 5 

Stephensville
	.649
	0.25
	
	


Commissioner Kenneth Gordon moved, seconded by Commissioner Karen Jewell, and unanimously carried to accept the bid from Morel Distributors for Items 1-4 and to accept the bid from Gaubert Oil Co. for Item 5. 
                                                                     * * * * 
A meeting of the Insurance/Finance Committee of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District was held at 4:00 p.m., Wednesday, May 24, 2022, at the Board office in Port Allen, LA. Daniel Hebert called the meeting to order. 

The following members were present:

Daniel Hebert, Chairman 

Earl Matherne, 1st Vice Chairman

Karen Jewell, Member
Bill Flynn, Ex-Officio Chairman
John Grezaffi, Ex-Officio Chairman
Absent: 

None

Also Present:
Commissioner Kenneth Gordon

Commissioner Spencer Harvey

Commissioner Tommy Thibodeaux

William Tyson, Executive Director

Richard Sparks, Levee Board Operations Superintendent

Kristy Jewell, Human Resource Analyst

Tiffany Weber, Administrative Program Specialist A

Janice Jarreau, Administrative Program Manager

Crissi Canezaro, Administrative Program Specialist A

1. Amending the 2021-2022 Budget - Mr. Will Tyson presented a revised budget for 2021-2022 to keep the budget within 5% of our original projections. Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Bill Flynn, and unanimously carried to approve the revised version of the budget. The committee asked questions related to projected fuel costs, reduced saltwater disposal, and the expense of maintaining the Belle River Boat Landing.
2. Adopting the 2022-2023 Budget – The committee reviewed the proposed budget for 2022-2023. Commissioner Earl Matherne moved, seconded by Commissioner Karen Jewell, and unanimously carried to adopt the proposed 2022-2023 budget

3. Discuss pay rate adjustments for Mobile Equipment Operator 1 and Mobile Equipment Operator 2 position - President John Grezaffi advised the committee that we are looking at ways to change the entry level rate for equipment drivers. ABLD currently has a policy in place which allows us to adjust the rate of a new hire with experience. If we hire someone with experience, we can adjust some of our other employees to bring them in line with that rate. He said we are discussing other changes that will be presented to the board next week. 

There being no further business to come before the committee, upon motion by Commissioner Karen Jewell and unanimously carried, the meeting adjourned. 

Respectfully submitted,

/s/Daniel Hebert, Chairman


/s/Earl Matherne, 1st Vice Chairman

/s/Karen Jewell, Member


/s/Bill Flynn, Ex-Officio Chairman







/s/John Grezaffi, Ex-Officio Chairman

After review, Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to approve the minutes of the May 24, 2022, meeting of the Finance Committee as presented.

                                                                     * * * * 
Mr. Will Tyson recommended approval of a request for Right of Entry from the Corps of Engineers for surveys for levee slide repairs in St. Martin Parish. Commissioner Tommy Thibodeaux so moved, seconded by Commissioner Sean McGee, and unanimously carried.
                                                                     * * * * 
Mr. Travis Johnson was recognized from CPRA. He had no report at this time.
                                                                    * * * * 
Mr. Nicholas Rockforte, Levee Board Attorney, said he had no new legal matters to report.

                                                                     * * * * 
Mrs. Janice Jarreau reported to the board that to adjust the pay for several of our employees, we could  use our existing promotion policy and hiring rule 6.5(g) for Equipment Operators 1 and 2.  If we hire a new employee with 1 ½ to 2 years experience, we could upgrade the salary of approximately 16 of our employees with the same experience level or better.  Commissioner Sean McGee moved, seconded by Commissioner Mark Guillory, and unanimously carried that subject to hiring a new employee under the 6.5(g) policy we would authorize our staff to upgrade other employees by the same percentage with the same experience level.  Commissioner Earl Matherne moved, seconded by Commissioner Kenneth Gordon, and unanimously carried to approve a request to detail Michael Sparks from Levee Maintenance Superintendent to Levee Board Operations Superintendent and promote following the detail. 
Commissioner Nickie Rockforte moved, seconded by Commissioner Karen Jewell, and unanimously carried to approve a request to detail Bobby Webber from Levee Foreman B to Levee Maintenance Superintendent and promote following the detail. 
Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to detail James Gonzales from Mobile Equipment Operator 2 to Levee Foreman B and promote following the detail. 
Commissioner Tommy Thibodeaux moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to approve the updated Promotion Policy as presented.

Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Nickie Rockforte, and unanimously carried to appoint Richard Sparks to the unclassified Superintendent position.

                                                                     * * * * 
Mr. Will Tyson said he was unable to reach the person who previously quoted for the fuel system at the Ravenswood Shop. We asked for new quotes and STT Service bid $30,435.07. Commissioner Sean McGee moved, seconded by Commissioner Tommy Thibodeaux, and unanimously carried to approve the quote from STT Service.
                                                                     * * * * 
There being no further business to come before the board, upon motion by Commissioner Mark Guillory and without objection, the meeting was adjourned. 
____________________________________           ____________________________________

Janice Jarreau, Secretary


           John Grezaffi, President

____________________________________

Linda Alwood, Contract Stenographer 
An Equal Opportunity Employer

